RUPARELIA FOUNDATION

PAYMENT VOUCHER
PAYMENT NO 499 ' Date:  27-Feb-2018
PAY M/S OTETE SAMSON HENRY
-

HQ. NO. DATED AMOUNT UGX 500,000/- —
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(INWORDS)  UGX Five hundred thousand Only
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BEING Payment made towards contribution to the school kids for the month of Feb 2018
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From: . Harinam sevadas <harinamsevadas@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, February 23, 2018 4:39 PM
To: TinA
Subject: Re: Humble request for your Monthly contribution!
Hare Krishna Tina Mataji,
Pranams!

Our gratitude for the kind seva.
We still have an account name with dfgd Bank:Otete Samson Henry.
I hope this alright.
Once again, our most gratitude and diyinely blessed wishes.
With gratefulness from;
Harinam seva das.

On Feb 23, 2018 4:22 PM, "TinA" <info@rupareliagroup.com> wrote:

Dear Harinam Sevdas p P

O T b leks
We commit to pay you Ushs 500,000 everymonth a;nd you can produce rice and sugar .
Please advise what name the ch':a;ue can we prepare in | (}tﬂ ‘

Regrads

Tina

From: Harinam sevadas [mailto:harinamsevadas@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, February 12, 2018 5:06 PM Wﬂ

To: TinA <info@rupareliagroup.com>
Subject: RE: Humble request for your Monthly contribution!
| 2% lafy,
o012
Please Tina 'Mataji,try your best for us for the proposed humble request. If it can be possible, the school kids
will be joyful to be welcome back from holidays with this wonderful program either this week or next. They
have been missing it for long now.

Best wishes!

V.
Harinam seva das. - oo @OC/ 16? M O”ﬁ
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From: | Harinam sevadas <harinamsevadas@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, March 02, 2018 2:47 PM
To: TinA
Subject: Re: Humble request for your Monthly contribution!
Hare Krishna Tina,

First and foremost,our continuous expression of gratitude.

ank number:01981011 03794;5 .dfcu,Mbarara branch.

As soon as 1 confirm the entry of the money,will send the Receipt by attach for keeping records.

I will equally request for your Whatsapp contact after we finish the School kids
"Free Vegetarian Food Program by next week to enable send you the

video footage,this will give you/Dr Sudhir the clear nature of the interesting
program from the great seva you have been doing for almost nine years now

to the Western communities in Uganda,

Blessed wishess

On Fri, Mar 2, 2018 at 11:35 AM, TinA <info@rupareliagroup.com> wrote:

Hare Krishna

The cheque is ready if you send us the bank number we can deposit the cheque for you

Tina

From: Harinam sevadas [mailto:harinamsevadas@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, February 27, 2018 6:18 PM

To: TinA <info@rupareliagroup.com>

Subject: Re: Humble request for your Monthly contribution!

Hare Krishna Mataji,
Our gratitude!
Blessed wishes!
Harinam seva das.
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